MINUTES OF THE SPECIAL MEETING OF THE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS AND SAFETY OF THE CITY OF JASPER
NOVEMBER 26, 2024

	The Board of Public Works and Safety of the City of Jasper, Indiana, met in special session at 9:00 am on Tuesday, November 26, 2024. 

CALL TO ORDER
         Presiding Officer Mayor Dean Vonderheide called the meeting to order at 9:14 a.m.   

ROLL CALL
         Clerk-Treasurer Kiersten Knies called the roll:
	Mayor Dean Vonderheide			Present
	Board member Timothy Bell   		Present
	Board member Nancy Eckerle 		Present

Also, present were Street Commissioner Jeffrey Theising, Street Department Project Technician Bob Sunderman, Clerk Treasurer Kiersten Knies, and City Attorney Renee Kabrick.  

Knies announced that in order to have a quorum for the meeting, a majority of the board members must be present.  All three board members were present, which is a majority, therefore; there was a quorum for the meeting. 

PURPOSE.  Mayor Vonderheide said the purpose of the special meeting was to open the 2025 supply bids for the City of Jasper.  

ANNUAL SUPPLY BIDS FOR 2023
 A Notice to Bidders for the 2025 supply bids appeared in the Herald on November 2 and November 9, 2024.  City Attorney Renee Kabrick then opened each bid by item number and bidder and publicly read each detailed bid.  

ITEM #1   	CRUSHED STONE
         1-A	FOB City stockpile at City Garage, 10,000 tons or less.  
Bidder’s Name  Cave Quarries, Inc.   Bidder’s Name Mulzer Crushed Stone, Inc.    	Sizes		Price Per Ton			     Sizes	Price Per Ton
	
	23
	$21.85
	23
	$22.30

	
	53
	$21.85
	53
	$22.30

	
	73
	$23.10
	73
	$22.30

	
	02
	$23.10
	02 
	$23.55

	
	05
	$23.10
	05
	$23.55

	
	08
	$24.25
	08 
	$24.25

	
	09
	$24.75
	09
	$24.80

	
	11A
	$25.35
	11A
	$25.65

	
	11B
	$24.35
	11B 
	$24.85

	
	12 
	$26.10
	12 
	$30.75

	
	Sand 
	$29.00
	Sand 
	$32.00

	
	 Rip rap 
	$24.75
	Riprap  
	$25.90

	
	Fill     
	21.35
	Fill    
	No Bid       




 1-B FOB suppliers’ stockpile, loaded on City trucks and weighed 10,000 tons or less.  
 Bidder’s Name  Cave Quarries, Inc.   Bidder’s Name Mulzer Crushed Stone, Inc.    	Sizes		 Price Per Ton                         Sizes                    Price Per Ton 
	
	23
	$22.75
	23 
	$16.60

	
	53 
	$22.75
	53  
	$14.10

	
	73
	$24.00
	73
	$14.10

	
	02
	$24.00
	02
	$16.60

	
	05
	$24.00
	05
	$16.60

	
	 08
	$25.25
	08 
	$16.60

	
	09
	$25.75
	09 
	$18.10

	 
	11A
	$26.35
	11A 
	$17.90

	
	11B 
	$25.35
	11B
	$11.60

	
	12
	$27.10
	12
	$19.75

	
	Sand
	$29.50
	Sand
	$13.00

	
	Riprap
	$25.75
	Riprap
	$17.75

	
	Fill     
	$22.75
	Fill
	No Bid


                                              
 ITEM #2    BITUMINOUS MATERIAL                                                               
Bidder— J. H. Rudolph & Co., Inc.           
2-A Description                                    Price per gallon	   Price per gallon     Price    
					  furnished & applied     FOB our plant       per ton
1. Liquid asphalt for seal coat AE-90 	$4.20 			No bid                                    
2. Liquid asphalt for tack coat AE-T   	$3.50 			No bid
3. Cover aggregate                                                                                          	$64.50                       
                        	 Bidder— Calcar Paving, Inc.           
2-A Description                                     Price per gallon	   Price per gallon       Price    
					   furnished & applied        FOB our plant    per ton
1. Liquid asphalt for seal coat AE-90               $3.90 		No bid                                                                                                 
2. Liquid asphalt for tack coat AE-T   	  $3.90 		No bid
3. Cover aggregate                                                                                                     $58.00                                      

2-B HMA for street widening, wedge and leveling or approaches.
Bidder	               J. H. Rudolph & Co., Inc.    Calcar Paving, Inc.    
        Description                         		Price Per Ton		       Price Per Ton
        HMA Base for Type A or B                    $ 105.00			$95.00     
        HMA Intermediate for Type A or B       $ 110.00		          $100.00
        HMA Surface for Type A or B               $ 135.00 		          $110.00
        HMA Surface VIRGIN                           $140.00		          $120.00

2-C Material for street patching.
Bidder	               J. H. Rudolph & Co., Inc.    Calcar Paving, Inc.    
      Description                                                   Price Per Ton	        Price Per Ton                     
      HMA Base for patching, Type A or B                 $210.00 		$185.00                                          
      HMA Intermediate for patching, Type A or B     $268.00 		$210.00
      HMA Surface for patching, Type A or B             $270.00 		$225.00
      HMA Surface VIRGIN	                                    $280.00		$240.00

2-D Furnish and spread 10,000 tons or more of hot asphaltic concrete with paving machine.		      	Bidder	     J.H. Rudolph & Co., Inc.   Calcar Paving, Inc.   
        Description                              	       Price Per Ton                            Price Per Ton     
        HMA Base, Type A or B             	$ 93.00			$82.00
        HMA Intermediate, Type A or B	$ 96.00			$85.00
        HMA Surface, Type A or B         	$ 110.00		            $97.00 
        HMA Surface VIRGIN                   	$117.00		          $101.00

                                   Bidder                 J.H. Rudolph & Co., Inc.  Calcar Paving, Inc.    
2-E Alleys and any other off-street paving       $160.00                                     $145.00
             
2-F Estimating and Inspection process-work incidental to items 2-B, 2-C, 2-D, and 2-E shall be included in the unit price of.

2-G Widening and/or Grade Change Projects-work incidental to items 2B, 2C, 2D and 2-E shall be included in the unit price of.

2-H   Notification Prior to Paving-work incidental to items 2B, 2C, 2D and 2E shall be included in the unit price of.

2-I   Utility covers-work incidental to items 2B, 2C, 2D and 2E shall be included in the unit price of.

2-J   Equipment including operators and laborers for incidental street construction
		           Bidder	       J.H. Rudloph & Co., Inc.   Calcar Paving, Inc.     
      DESCRIPTION                                   Price Per Hour          Price Per Hour
       Widener with operator                              $215.00		$215.00
       Backhoe with operator                              $145.00		$130.00
       Grader with operator                                 $155.00 		$145.00	
       Tracked Excavator with operator              $165.00		$175.00
       Roller with operator                                  $140.00 		$135.00    
       Small Milling Machine with operator       $180.00		$175.00
       Engineer/Surveyor w/pick-up etc.             $ 95.00 		$ 86.00        
       Laborer 		                                      $ 67.00		$ 64.00
       Skid Steer with operator                            $150.00 		$130.00
       Voluntary Bid-Broom with operator         $165.00		$No Bid
       
       Placing of stone or millings           Price Per Square Yard          Price Per Square Yard
                                                                        $2.55                                           $2.25

2-K Placing of 8 oz. non-woven fabric on various City streets.
      		       Bidder	         J. H. Rudolph Co., Inc.   Calcar Paving, Inc.       
                     Full Width		Price Per Square Yard   Price Per Square Yard           
                    500 - 1,000   Sq. Yds.                      $11.15		$9.30
                 1,001 - 5,000   Sq. Yds.                      $10.00		$8.50
                 5,001 - 10,000 Sq. Yds.                      $9.00		$7.75
               10,001 or more Sq. Yds.                       $8.25		$7.25

                     Over Joints		Price Per Linear Foot       Price Per Linear Foot          
                   1 Ft. Width                                        $2.35 		$2.35
                   3 Ft. Width                                        $6.35 		$6.00

2-L Raising of manholes according to specs.      No Bid                   $1,350.00 each	

2-M Milling of blacktop streets. 
      	       Bidder	                J H Rudolph Co., Inc.   Calcar Paving, Inc.     
Depth         	            Quantity                Price per square yard    Price per square yard       
1” to 2”	5,000 Sq Yds to 10,000 Sq Yds         $2.70	            	$1.95
3” to 4”	5,000 Sq Yds to 10,000 Sq Yds         $4.00			$2.20
5” to 6”        	5,000 Sq Yds to 10,000 Sq Yds	$4.90			$2.60
1” to 2”         10,001 Sq Yds to 15,000 Sq Yds	$2.55			$1.85
3” to 4”         10,001 Sq Yds to 15,000 Sq Yds	$3.95    		$2.10
5” to 6”         10,001 Sq Yds to 15,000 Sq Yds          $4.80			$2.40
	  
   Milling of concrete streets.
      Description                                             Price Per Square Yard   Price Per Square Yard
      30” along gutter pan	0-1½” depth                  $3.50			$3.65
      Full width                         0-1½” depth                   $4.20 		$4.40
2-N Trucks for hauling millings
      		   Bidder          J H Rudolph Co., Inc.      Calcar Paving, Inc.    
                     Description 			Price Per Hour          Price Per Hour      
                    Single Axle Truck                           $130.00 		$114.00
                    Tandem Axle Truck                        $165.00		$120.00
                    Tri Axle Truck                                $150.00		$125.00
                    Quad Axle Truck			    $155.00		$130.00
                    Semi-Truck                                     $165.00 		$140.00
                    
2-O Maintain traffic 
    		       Bidder	     J H Rudolph Co., Inc.        Calcar Paving, Inc.        
         Description		              Price Per Hour               Price Per Hour
 Signs                                                    $ 1.015			$    1.05    
 Signs w/flashing light                          $ 1.75			$    1.75    
  	          Type III, barricades                             $ 2.50			$    2.25    
	          Drums                                                  $ 1.15			$    1.00    
                       Flagger                                               $ 67.00			$ 64.00 
                       Night Watchman w/pick-up              $125.00			$115.00
                       Maintain Traffic Person w/pick-up   $120.00		   	$105.00
						
Per Lineal Ft          	       Per Lineal Ft
Temporary removal of stripping tape 	    $1.70			$2.15

Item #3	Bituminous Patching Material
Patching material, 200 tons or more.
			     Bidder’s Name	        Bidder’s Name	        Bidder’s Name
	                        Cave Quarries, Inc.	  J.H. Rudolph Co., Inc.       Flynn Bros.
			               Price per ton          Price per ton 		Price per ton	
HMA Base, Type A or B      $74.00 FOB Plant   $72.00 FOB Plant                   No Bid     .                  
                                               $88.00 Delivered   No Bid Delivered                    No Bid     .                
HMA Intermediate, Type   
            A or B                         $81.00 FOB Plant  $76.00 FOB Plant                 No Bid     .    
                                                $95.00 Delivered   No Bid Delivered                  No Bid     .                     

HMA Surface, Type A or B   $85.00 FOB Plant  $78.00 FOB Plant                 No Bid      .                  
                                                $109.00 Delivered No Bid Delivered                 No Bid      .                         

High Performance/Cold Mix  No Bid FOB Plant $120.00 FOB Plant  $115.00 FOB Plant.     
                                                No Bid Delivered  $140.00 Delivered     $143.00 Delivered. 
Location of Bidder’s Plant	Otwell or Paoli, IN   Dale, IN                    Louisville, KY   .             

Item #4      Concrete & Flowable Fill
FOB to various locations throughout the city limits (50 C.Y. pours or less)

      Bidders Name                     Bidders Name
                                     Concrete Supply, Inc.                 IMI, LLC    
Sizes                               Price Per C.Y.                          Price Per C.Y.
5 bags mix                             $153.50 			$156.00
5-1/2 bag                               $155.50 			$159.00
6 bag                                     $157.50 		 	            $162.00
3000 PSI                               $147.50   			$152.00
3500 PSI                               $149.50 				$154.50
4000 PSI                               $151.50 			            $157.00
4500 PSI                               $153.50 			            $159.50
Flowable Fill                        $135.50 			            $120.00
Calcium Chloride                 $5.00      	           	    	   $ 3.75    
Low Chloride Accel             $6.50      	                           $ 5.50 
Winter Heat Charge             $5.50      		           	$ 5.50    

Price Per Load                                      Price Per Load                             
Small Load Charge       $250.00                                     Small Load Charge     $250.00
applies to loads less than 4 CY                                     applies to loads less than 4 CY

Fuel Surcharge        $20.00 per load                                     $20.00 per load
   
Item #5 Gasoline, unleaded, 10% Ethanol – All Grades
Bidder’s Name           				Bidder’s Name                              
Ackerman Partners, LLC 				SynEnergy, Company, Inc.

Price Per Gallon           Octane     			Price Per Gallon           Octane                                 
          1.8959                   87 Ethanol               	1.8834                 87 Ethanol     
          No Bid                89 Ethanol               		No Bid                89 Ethanol               
          No Bid                91 Ethanol               		No Bid                91 Ethanol
          No Bid                E-85                        		No Bid                E-85                        
	

Item #6 Diesel Fuel-Premium Grade-15 PPM Sulfur Fuel-Dyed and Clear 
Premium diesel fuel 25,000 gallons or less delivered to Jasper Street Dept Tank. 

Bidder’s Name                     Bidder’s Name
                                                Ackerman Oil Co., Inc.  Synenergy Partners, LLC    
No 2 Diesel                                         2.346 			              2.311
No 2 Winter Blend Diesel                  2.371		                          2.336
Biodiesel B-20                                    No Bid			    	No Bid
Biodiesel B-5                                      No Bid				No Bid
Biodiesel B-5 Winter Blend		No Bid				No Bid
Dyed No 2 Diesel                               2.351	                        	   2.314
Dyed No 2 Diesel Winter blend	2.376 			               2.339
Dyed Biodiesel B-20                          No Bid 			No Bid
Dyed Biodiesel B-5                            No Bid			            No Bid
Dyed Biodiesel B-5 Winter Blend     No Bid				No Bid
	
Item #7 Supply 500 gallons or more of all grades of gasoline or diesel. FOB supplier
location. Access to fuel 24 hours per day, every day of the year
Bidder’s Name	
 Ackerman Oil Co., Inc.     
Unleaded Ethanol, 87 octane                       1.8959             
Unleaded Ethanol, 89 octane                       No Bid              
Premium Unleaded Ethanol                         No Bid
E-85                                                              No Bid 
No. 2 Diesel                                                  2.346
No. 2 Diesel Fuel, winter blend                    2.371             
Dyed No. 2 Diesel Fuel                                2.351     
Dyed No. 2 Diesel Fuel, winter blend	          2.376   
Biodiesel B-5				          None
Biodiesel B-5(-20 F)			          None 
Vehicle card fee, per month                          None                             
	
Item #8 Concrete Sidewalk Replacement Program					
Bidder          	      Ralph Schroering Const, LLC       
            	                                              Price per sq ft                    
Man-made Monolithic sidewalk & curb 5"               $8.50
Man-made Sidewalk & Curb 		     5"               $6.20
Man-made ADA curb ramp                    5"               $9.00
Man-made driveway crossing                 6"               $7.25
Man-made Industrial/Commercial          6"               $8.50
     driveway crossing
                                                	          Price Per Lin Ft     
Standard curb & gutter		                  $26.00

Street Commissioner Jeff Theising requested the bids be taken under advisement for further review and to come back at the next meeting with a recommendation.

ADJOURNMENT.  There being no further business to come before the board, a motion was made by Nancy Eckerle and seconded by Tim Bell to adjourn the meeting at 9.48 am.  Motion carried 3-0.

The minutes were hereby approved ____with         without corrections or clarification this 10th day of December 2024.
					_____________________________   
                                                                         Mayor Dean M. Vonderheide
						 Presiding Officer
Attest:
_______________________________
 Kiersten Knies, Clerk-Treasurer



1

